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Introduction
Millions of people worldwide suffer from obesity, a chronic 

medical condition. Multiple factors, including genetics, environmental 
influences, and behavioral patterns, contribute to this complicated 
disease. Understanding the role of cognitive processes in obesity and its 
management has received more attention in recent years. The approach 
bias is one such cognitive process [1].

The automatic tendency to approach or seek out rewarding stimuli, 
such as food, that are associated with a specific behavior or situation is 
known as approach bias. A bias toward food can contribute to weight 
gain and overeating in the context of obesity. On the other hand, 
approach bias can be used to manage obesity.

A cognitive training method known as approach bias modification 
(ABM) aims to reduce approach bias toward food and encourage 
healthier eating habits. ABM entails teaching people to approach 
nonfood stimuli while avoiding food-related stimuli, which can 
eventually reduce approach bias toward food. Computer-based 
training, virtual reality, and mobile applications are all ways that ABM 
can be implemented [2].

The efficacy of ABM in the management of obesity has been the 
subject of several studies. ABM was found to be associated with a 
significant reduction in food approach bias and weight loss in obese 
individuals in a systematic review and meta-analysis of RCTs. ABM 
and cognitive-behavioral therapy were found to be more effective than 
cognitive-behavioral therapy on its own in promoting weight loss in 
another RCT.

Although the underlying mechanisms of ABM are not completely 
understood, it is believed to function by altering the brain's automatic 
associations between food and reward. ABM can lessen approach bias 
toward food by pairing reward with non-food stimuli on a regular basis 
[3]. This can make new associations stronger and weaker, which can 
reduce approach bias toward food.

Description
ABM is a promising strategy for controlling obesity, but it has some 

drawbacks. Individual factors, such as motivation to alter eating habits 
and baseline levels of approach bias, may influence ABM's efficacy. 
Additionally, it is unknown what the long-term effects of ABM will be 
on weight loss and maintenance.

Obesity and its management are influenced by a cognitive 
process known as the approach bias toward food. In reducing the 
approach bias toward food and promoting healthier eating behaviors, 
strategies like approach bias modification (ABM) have demonstrated 
promising results. Computer-based training, virtual reality, and mobile 
applications are all options for delivering these interventions. ABM 
entails teaching people to approach non-food stimuli while avoiding 
food-related stimuli, which can eventually reduce approach bias toward 
food [4,5].

A number of studies have looked into how effective ABM is for 
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managing obesity, and the results showed that people with obesity lost 
weight and had less food approach bias. Additionally, when compared 
to cognitive-behavioral therapy on its own, ABM has been shown to be 
more effective.

Although the underlying mechanisms of ABM are not completely 
understood, it is thought to function by altering the brain's automatic 
associations between food and reward. ABM can lessen approach bias 
toward food by pairing reward with non-food stimuli on a consistent 
basis. This can strengthen new associations and weaken existing ones.

However, there are some drawbacks to ABM. Individual factors, 
such as motivation to alter eating habits and baseline levels of approach 
bias, may influence ABM's efficacy. Additionally, it is unknown what 
the long-term effects of ABM will be on weight loss and maintenance 
[6-8].

Conclusion
Approach bias is a cognitive process that is significant in the 

treatment and prevention of obesity. ABM is a promising strategy that 
has the potential to reduce food bias and encourage healthier eating 
habits. To fully comprehend ABM's underlying mechanisms and long-
term effects, additional research is required. However, ABM has the 
potential to be a useful tool in the fight against obesity as well as in 
enhancing the overall health and well-being of obese people.
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