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Abstract:
Human skin is one of the most complex body organs that 
functions as a physical barrier against water loss and en-
vironmental stressors including the UVR, ROS, patho-
gens, chemicals and physical agents. Skin aging, fragility, 
thinning, laxity, enlarged pores, dryness, fine lines, and 
wrinkles happen to skin texture as a result of chronic ex-
posure to intrinsic and extrinsic destructive factors. This 
leads to the growing importance of the cosmetic industry. 
Therefore, we need to discover and investigate harmless 
and efficient natural raw ingredients. According to stud-
ies, cyanobacteria are rich sources of metabolites, which 
can be used to fight against skin-related problems (Ariede 
et al., 2017). Cyanobacteria are morphologically diverse 
photosynthetic prokaryotes that are broadly distributed 
in both terrestrial and aquatic environments. Cyanobac-
teria have developed especial mechanisms to help them 
endure the extreme conditions such as highlight intensi-
ties, low or high temperatures, pH and salinity (Evangelis-
ta et al., 2008). Therefore, various secondary metabolites 
can be extracted from them. For instance, MAAs, poly-
saccharides, pigments, scytonemin, antioxidants, and ca-
rotenoids are some of the beneficial metabolites extract-
ed from cyanobacteria (Sathasivam et al., 2017). Diverse 
cyanobacteria strains are now being broadly used in skin 
care products for various skin conditions by acting as 

sunscreens, anti-wrinkling agents, moisturizer or texture 
enhancing agents) Derikvand et al., 2017). Some of the 
most beneficial cyanobacterial strains that have presented 
cosmeceutical properties are Spirulina, Nostoc, Anabena 
sp., Oscillatoria sp., Scytonema sp., Chroococcidiopsis 
sp. and Lyngbya sp. Therefore, cyanobacteria can be an 
appropriate source of novel bioactive compounds for the 
cosmetic industry.
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