
Examinations by Completing a Residency in Dermatology
Donaldson Brett*

Depatment of Dermatology, University of Tehran Medical Sciences, Tehran, Iran
*Corresponding author: Donaldson Brett, Depatment of Dermatology, University of Tehran Medical Sciences, Tehran, Iran, E-mail: Brett@gmail.com

Received date: July 02, 2021; Accepted date: July 16, 2021; Published date: July 23, 2021

INTRODUCTION
Dermatology is the branch of medicine dealing with the skin. It is a

speciality with both medical and surgical aspects. A dermatologist is a
specialist medical doctor who manages diseases related to skin, hair,
nails, and some cosmetic problems. Dermatologists have been leaders
in the field of cosmetic surgery. Some dermatologists complete
fellowships in surgical dermatology. Many are trained in their
residency on the use of botulinum toxin, fillers, and laser surgery.
Some dermatologists perform cosmetic procedures including
liposuction, blepharoplasty, and face lifts. Most dermatologists limit
their cosmetic practice to minimally invasive procedures. Despite an
absence of formal guidelines from the American Board of
Dermatology, many cosmetic fellowships are offered in both surgery
and laser medicine. A dermatopathologist is a pathologist or
dermatologist who specializes in the pathology of the skin. This field
is shared by dermatologists and pathologists. Usually, a dermatologist
or pathologist completes one year of dermatopathology fellowship.
This usually includes six months of general pathology and six months
of dermatopathology. Alumni of both specialties can qualify as
dermatopathologists. At the completion of a standard residency in
dermatology, many dermatologists are also competent at
dermatopathology. Some dermatopathologists qualify to sit for their
examinations by completing a residency in dermatology and one in
pathology.

This field specializes in the treatment of immune-mediated skin
diseases such as lupus, bullous pemphigoid, pemphigus vulgaris, and
other immune-mediated skin disorders. Specialists in this field often
run their own immunopathology labs. Immunodermatology testing is
essential for the correct diagnosis and treatment of many diseases
affecting epithelial organs including skin, mucous membranes,
gastrointestinal and respiratory tracts. The various diseases often
overlap in clinical and histological presentation and, although the
diseases themselves are not common, may present with features of
common skin disorders such as urticaria, eczema and chronic itch.
Therefore, the diagnosis of an immunodermatological disease is often
delayed. Tests are performed on blood and tissues that are sent to
various laboratories from medical facilities and referring physicians

across the United States. The dermatologic subspecialty called Mohs
surgery focuses on the excision of skin cancers using a technique that
allows intraoperative assessment of most of the peripheral and deep
tumor margins. Physicians trained in this technique must be
comfortable with both pathology and surgery, and dermatologists
receive extensive training in both during their residency. Physicians
who perform Mohs surgery can receive training in this specialized
technique during their dermatology residency, but many seek
additional training either through preceptorships to join the American
Society for Mohs Surgery or through formal one- to two-year Mohs
surgery fellowship training programs administered by the American
College of Mohs Surgery. This technique requires the integration of
the same doctor in two different capacities - surgeon and pathologist.
In case either of the two responsibilities is assigned to another doctor
or qualified health-care professional, it is not considered to be Mohs
surgery. Physicians can qualify for this specialization by completing
both a pediatric residency and a dermatology residency. Or they might
elect to complete a post-residency fellowship. This field encompasses
the complex diseases of the neonates, hereditary skin diseases or
genodermatoses, and the many difficulties of working with the
pediatric population.

Teledermatology is a form of dermatological practice in which
telecommunication technologies are used to exchange medical
information and treatment through audio, visual, and data
communication, including photos of dermatologic conditions, between
dermatologists and nondermatologists who are evaluating patients,
along with dermatologists directly with patients via distance. This
subspecialty deals with options to view skin conditions over a large
distance to provide knowledge exchange to establish second-opinion
services for experts, or to use this for follow-up of individuals with
chronic skin conditions. Teledermatology can reduce wait times by
allowing dermatologists to treat minor conditions online while serious
conditions requiring immediate care are given priority for
appointments. Dermatoepidemiology is the study of skin disease at the
population level. One of its aspects is the determination of the global
burden of skin diseases.
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