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Introduction
Intestinal obstruction (IO) in pregnancy, first reported by Houston in 1830, 
is a rare but extremely serious condition that has a high maternal and fe-
tal mortality rate owing to delayed diagnosis. The reported incidence of 
intestinal obstruction complicating pregnancy ranges from one in every 
66,431 to one in 1,500 births. A retrospective study of 66 cases of intestinal 
obstruction complicating pregnancy and the puerperium, found that ad-
hesive IO (58%), volvulus (24%), and intussusception (5%) were the most 
common causes of mechanical bowel obstruction. 77% of patients with ad-
hesive intestinal obstruction gave history of previous abdominal or pelvic 
surgery [1].

In a descending order of frequency, volvulus of the colon can occur in the 
sigmoid colon, caecum, splenic flexure, and transverse colon. Sigmoid 
volvulus has a diverse geographical and racial distribution, and while it is 
extremely common in developing countries such as African nations, where 
it mainly affects young male patients, it is much less common in the West, 
where it affects the elderly and frail female patients. The Western type of 
sigmoid volvulus is attributed to persistent constipation; however, a high 
fiber diet has been identified as a key factor in the development of sigmoid 
volvulus in African people [2].

Although sigmoid volvulus (SV) is rare, it is one of the most common 
causes of bowel obstruction that occurs in pregnancy, making up to 24% 
of reported cases. The prompt diagnosis and timely management of this 
condition is challenging because its clinical picture is usually masked by 
the physiological changes of pregnancy which adds to the morbidity and 
mortality rates associated with this condition. Therefore, early diagnosis 
and timely surgical intervention are mandatory to improving the overall 
outcome [3].

In this case report, we present the case of a 34 week pregnant lady present-
ing with acute abdominal pain and features of bowel obstruction due to 
sigmoid volvulus, and her initial, surgical and postoperative management.

Case Report
A 24 year old Egyptian pregnant lady, gravida 1 and para 0, presented to 
our hospital with 2 days history of intermittent lower abdominal pain that 
has been exacerbated over the few hours prior to her presentation, severe 
abdominal distension, and absolute constipation. She had non-contributo-
ry past medical or surgical history with no previous abdominal or pelvic 
surgeries. Her pregnancy had been uneventful until that presentation. She 
reported taking up to 4 grams/day of Acetaminophen at home with mini-
mal pain relief.

On examination, she was extremely agitated and uncomfortable, her pulse 
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was 138 beats per minute, her blood pressure was 85/55 mmHg, her respi-
ratory rate was 32 breaths per minute and her temperature was 38.2 C. Her 
abdominal examination revealed marked left lower quadrant tenderness, 
rebound tenderness and rigidity.

Her laboratory investigations revealed leukocytosis with left shift 
(23.2x10^9/L), serum creatinine and BUN were 1.9 mg/dl and 42 mg/dl 
respectively. Her serum lactate was 5.1 mg/dl. Bedside ultrasound revealed 
turbid fluid reaching the hepato-renal angle. Aspiration of this fluid, with 
aseptic technique, under ultrasound guidance yielded a seropurulent dis-
charge. Decision was taken for exploratory laparotomy hand in hand with 
IV fluid resuscitation and antibiotics (2 gm of Ceftriaxone and 500 mg of 
Metronidazole). The patient’s mean arterial pressure (MAP) was still 60 
mmHg despite adequate fluid replacement, so a loading dose of IV nor-
epinephrine infusion was started at a rate of 10 mcg/min followed by a 
maintenance dose of 6 mcg/min to optimize patient’s blood pressure (BP).

General surgery team was called for intra-operative attendance and patient 
was transferred to the operating room. A midline abdominal incision with 
supra-umbilical extension was performed. Upon entry into the peritoneal 
cavity, about 300 ml of seropurulent exudates were found and suctioned. 
The sigmoid and transverse colon was markedly dilated and a picture of 
sigmoid volvulus was found. The dilated segment of the colon proximal to 
the site of obstruction friable and gangrenous as shown in Figure 1.

Figure 1: showing dilated gangrenous colon proximal to site of obstruc-
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tion.

A lower segment caesarean section was done yielding a live female infant 
weighing 1950 grams whose APGAR scores were 8 at 1 minute and 9 at 5 
minutes. Mobilization and resection of the dilated gangrenous segment of 
the colon was performed by the general surgery team and diverting colos-
tomy with a Hartman’s procedure was done. 2 wide bore intra-peritoneal 
were placed and mass closure of the anterior abdominal wall was done. 
Delayed primary closure of the skin was undertaken 48 hours later after 
showing no signs of surgical site infection.

Post-operatively, the patient was kept on broad on broad-spectrum anti-
biotics and was transferred to the intensive care unit (ICU) for postopera-
tive care. She was gradually weaned off cardiovascular support and had a 
smooth postoperative course. She was discharged home 10 days later.

Discussion
Intestinal obstruction has a low incidence in pregnancy ranging from 1 in 
1500 to 1 in 66431 deliveries. Its causes during pregnancy include congeni-
tal or surgical adhesions, volvulus, intussusceptions, hernia, and appendi-
citis. Sigmoid volvulus is one of the most prevalent causes accounting for 
up to 24% of cases [4].

Pregnancy itself is thought to be the trigger for sigmoid volvulus where 
the gravid uterus may cause it by displacing, compressing, and partially 
obstructing a redundant or abnormally long sigmoid colon. This could ex-
plain why sigmoid volvulus occurs more frequently in the third trimester 
of pregnancy as shown in our case who presented at 34 weeks gestation. 
Despite the higher risk in the third trimester, reports of this problem oc-
curring in the first trimester as well as the puerperium have been reported 
[5].

When a pregnant woman experiences a clinical trial of abdominal pain, 
distension, and absolute constipation, the diagnosis of sigmoid volvulus 
should be considered. It has been observed in literature, in match with our 
case, that the mean time from the onset of obstruction to clinical presenta-
tion is 48 hours. This is mainly due to the fact that pregnancy can conceal 
the clinical picture by causing abdominal pain, nausea, and leukocytosis in 
otherwise healthy women [6].

This delay in diagnosis and surgical intervention in pregnancy has a sub-
stantial impact on the maternal and fetal final outcomes. These outcomes 
have been directly related to the degree of bowel ischemia and subsequent 
sepsis. Literature has shown that all maternal deaths occurred in patients 
who had a two days or more delay in presentation and surgical interven-
tion. Individuals who presented after 48 hours of onset of symptoms had 
5 fetal deaths, compared to 2 fetal deaths in patients who presented early 
in the disease's course. This finding emphasises the importance of a high 
degree of clinical suspicion in cases of intestinal obstruction in pregnant 
women. This information should be stressed to general practitioners and 
community obstetricians who are largely responsible for the treatment of 
these individuals [7].

Intestinal obstruction in pregnant women is treated in the same way as 
in non-pregnant women. Early surgical intervention is the cornerstone of 
treatment preferably via a midline vertical laparotomy. If adequate intesti-
nal exposure cannot be acquired due to a larger gravid uterus in the third 
trimester, a caesarean section must be performed. The whole bowel should 
be meticulously explored for other sites of obstruction. Intestinal viability 
must be carefully checked and segmental resection with or without anasto-
mosis is frequently required [8].

Conclusion
Sigmoid volvulus complicating pregnancy is extremely rare, however, 
when it occurs, may lead to considerable maternal and fetal morbidity 
and mortality. In patients who present with abdominal pain, distension, 
and absolute constipation, a high index of clinical suspicion is required for 
prompt diagnosis. Delayed diagnosis and treatment results in higher fetal 
and maternal morbidity and mortality especially after 48 hours. Therefore, 
early diagnosis and appropriate surgical intervention is crucial to improv-
ing maternal and fetal outcomes as shown in our case.
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